

December 16, 2020 - ONLINE AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract	Contract	LDKey	Bidder Name	Appraised Price	Sale Amount
1	C22180324	9000002233	NO BID	\$31,742.10	\$0.00
2	C22160055	9000001009	Dale R Richardson	\$55,596.38	\$55,596.38
4	C22160237	118164	J&R Sundberg Inc	\$6,107.70	\$10,100.00
5	C22200053	100682	NO BID	\$2,362.50	\$0.00
6	C22180217	9000002094	Robert Hsu	\$6,133.66	\$6,213.66
7	C22180351	9000002237	NO BID	\$39,999.00	\$0.00
8	C22200120	9000002751	NO BID	\$29,000.00	\$0.00
9	C22180256	101774	NO BID	\$2,743.60	\$0.00
10	C22180337	102880	NO BID	\$6,115.20	\$0.00
11	C22170332	9000001715	NO BID	\$5,936.37	\$0.00
12	C22200007	123653	Miguel Martinez	\$3,307.50	\$3,307.50
13	C22190137	123656	NO BID	\$11,542.50	\$0.00
14	C22190044	9000002292	NO BID	\$7,085.23	\$0.00
15	C22190012	105072	NO BID	\$1,240.00	\$0.00
16	C22170315	9000001693	NO BID	\$7,266.00	\$0.00
18	C22190179	123194	Xuan Yang	\$972.00	\$1,075.00
19	C22190038	105308	NO BID	\$8,160.89	\$0.00
20	C22200051	124097	NO BID	\$7,218.02	\$0.00
21	C22180108	105313	NO BID	\$1,543.22	\$0.00
22	C22190275	123081	Brandy Maki	\$3,825.00	\$3,825.00
23	C22180365	9000002238	NO BID	\$3,865.66	\$0.00
24	C22170320	105458	NO BID	\$1,567.78	\$0.00
25	C22170327	118362	NO BID	\$9,786.33	\$0.00
26	C22200129	9000002753	NO BID	\$3,105.00	\$0.00
27	C22180072	105478	NO BID	\$3,175.33	\$0.00
28	C22170024	9000001316	NO BID	\$7,770.00	\$0.00
29	C22190148	118090	Miguel Martinez	\$3,633.41	\$3,633.41

Tract	Contract	LDKey	Bidder Name	Appraised Price	Sale Amount
31	C22200130	105812	NO BID	\$65,880.00	\$0.00
33	C22160056	106230	Larry P Jacques	\$711.18	\$1,581.00
34	C22180129	9000001996	NO BID	\$8,525.39	\$0.00
35	C22110121	36194	Ryan Bruckelmyer	\$998.40	\$2,225.00
36	C22190079	123821	Bruce M Schuette	\$180,000.00	\$180,100.00
37	C22190156	108049	NO BID	\$68,850.00	\$0.00
38	C22200011	9000002652	NO BID	\$18,527.67	\$0.00
39	C22200012	122841	NO BID	\$12,756.48	\$0.00
40	C22200141	108339	NO BID	\$73,920.00	\$0.00
42	C22200152	122853	NO BID	\$74,300.00	\$0.00
43	C22200154	118132	NO BID	\$12,900.00	\$0.00
45	C22180081	110890	NO BID	\$85,570.45	\$0.00
46	C22190283	9000002614	Raymond F Kvidera	\$4,881.60	\$4,881.60
47	C22190261	113563	NO BID	\$11,169.00	\$0.00
49	C22200110	124009	NO BID	\$4,200.00	\$0.00

Total Tracts	42	Total Value	\$885,204.57	
Pulled Tracts	0	Pulled Tracts Value	\$0.00	
Net Available Tracts	42	Net Total Value	\$885,204.57	\$272,538.55
Total Tracts Sold	11			
Percent of Available Tracts Sold	26.19%	Percent of Appraised Value Sold		30.79%