

## March 2021 - ONLINE AUCTION SUMMARY

<b>Tract</b>	<b>Contract</b>	<b>LDKey</b>	<b>Bidder Name</b>	<b>Appraised Price</b>	<b>Sale Amount</b>
1	C22180324	9000002233	Joseph Scott Widmer and Lonnie Andrea	\$31,742.00	\$31,742.00
2	C22160055	9000001009	Amy Kotajarvi	\$55,595.00	\$55,595.00
3	C22200243	100568	NO BID	\$17,550.00	\$0.00
4	C22200053	100682	NO BID	\$2,362.00	\$0.00
5	C22180351	9000002237	NO BID	\$37,999.00	\$0.00
6	C22180256	101774	NO BID	\$2,600.00	\$0.00
7	C22180337	102880	NO BID	\$5,800.00	\$0.00
8	C22170332	9000001715	NO BID	\$5,936.00	\$0.00
9	C22200183	104236	NO BID	\$31,275.00	\$0.00
10	C22190137	123656	NO BID	\$11,542.00	\$0.00
11	C22190044	9000002292	NO BID	\$6,375.00	\$0.00
12	C22190012	105072	Kay Rand Morgan	\$999.00	\$999.00
13	C22170315	9000001693	Michael Smith	\$6,540.00	\$6,700.00
14	C22200072	122801	NO BID	\$5,850.00	\$0.00
15	C22200051	124097	NO BID	\$6,843.29	\$0.00
16	C22180108	105313	Renee K Jerry	\$1,235.00	\$1,235.00
17	C22170327	118362	NO BID	\$8,800.00	\$0.00
18	C22200129	9000002753	NO BID	\$2,485.00	\$0.00
19	C22180072	105478	NO BID	\$3,175.00	\$0.00
20	C22170024	9000001316	PULLED	\$7,770.00	\$0.00
21	C22190220	123208	Sara Ann Stone	\$3,700.00	\$3,700.00
22	C22180071	105566	NO BID	\$7,875.00	\$0.00
23	C22200130	105812	NO BID	\$52,710.00	\$0.00
24	C22180129	9000001996	Sophia Elaine Betancourt	\$7,508.70	\$7,508.70
25	C22110121	36194	Christopher J Simonson	\$998.00	\$2,025.00
26	C22200191	106566	Jeff D Lindell	\$2,400.00	\$2,400.00

<b>Tract</b>	<b>Contract</b>	<b>LDKey</b>	<b>Bidder Name</b>	<b>Appraised Price</b>	<b>Sale Amount</b>
27	C22200193	122487	PULLED	\$40,000.00	\$0.00
28	C22200201	107834	Jacob Jerome Friend	\$27,300.00	\$27,300.00
29	C22190156	108049	NO BID	\$61,965.00	\$0.00
30	C22200011	9000002652	NO BID	\$16,675.00	\$0.00
31	C22200141	108339	NO BID	\$59,136.00	\$0.00
32	C22200268	123732	NO BID	\$12,750.00	\$0.00
33	C22200207	122272	NO BID	\$90,800.00	\$0.00
34	C22200152	122853	NO BID	\$66,870.00	\$0.00
35	C22200111	109785	NO BID	\$46,500.00	\$0.00
36	C22200172	110646	NO BID	\$19,000.00	\$0.00
37	C22200154	118132	Seethong Yang	\$10,320.00	\$10,320.00
38	C22180081	110890	NO BID	\$68,456.00	\$0.00
39	C22200221	122583	April Vogel	\$77,000.00	\$77,000.00
40	C22190261	113563	NO BID	\$10,000.00	\$0.00
41	C22200110	124009	Sophia Elaine Betancourt	\$3,990.00	\$4,090.00
<b>Total Tracts</b>			41	<b>Total Value</b>	\$938,426.99
<b>Pulled Tracts</b>			2	<b>Pulled Tracts Value</b>	\$0.00
<b>Net Available Tracts</b>			39	<b>Net Total Value</b>	\$938,426.99
<b>Total Tracts Sold</b>			13		\$230,614.70
<b>Percent of Available Tracts Sold</b>			33.33%	<b>Percent of Appraised Value Sold</b>	24.57%