



Timber Auction Results

February 25, 2021

Sealed Bid Auction

Tract	Contract		Bidder	Appraised Price	Bidup	Sold Price	Down Payment
1	C19210001		Brad Horsmann Logging, LLC	\$2,575.00	33%	\$3,418.00	\$386.25
2	C19210002		Boise White Paper LLC	\$28,978.50	25%	\$36,363.30	\$4,346.78
3	C19210003		No Bid	\$40,871.44			
4	C19210004		Boise White Paper LLC	\$21,092.21	28%	\$26,988.20	\$3,163.83
5	C19210029		Shermer Logging	\$30,768.15	128%	\$70,303.19	\$4,615.22
6	C19210006		Mike Nielsen Logging	\$17,374.13	73%	\$30,054.80	\$2,606.12
7	C19210007		Shermer Logging	\$20,744.90	117%	\$45,024.85	\$3,111.74
8	C19210008		Mike Nielsen Logging	\$12,814.65	88%	\$24,039.95	\$1,922.20
9	C19210027		Jatco Inc.	\$15,165.52	32%	\$20,005.84	\$2,274.83
10	C19210010		UPM Blandin Forestry	\$16,645.28	3%	\$17,136.74	\$2,496.79
11	C19210030		Futurewood Corporation	\$46,138.19	16%	\$53,611.77	\$6,920.73
12	C19210012		No Bid	\$19,220.06			
13	C19210028		Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC	\$52,986.94	35%	\$71,299.78	\$7,948.04
14	C19210014		Raad Logging Inc	\$10,931.01	71%	\$18,695.25	\$1,639.65
15	C19210015		No Bid	\$13,340.08			
16	C19210016		No Bid	\$7,442.26			
17	C19210017		Fjeran Forest Products Llc	\$3,225.00	37%	\$4,417.00	\$483.75
18	C19210018		Fjeran Forest Products Llc	\$2,695.62	6%	\$2,848.86	\$404.34
19	C19210019		Richard Godden	\$23,339.45	19%	\$27,840.00	\$3,500.92
20	C19210020		Sappi Fine Paper	\$15,118.82	126%	\$34,133.00	\$2,267.82
21	C19210021		Futurewood Corporation	\$31,987.04	67%	\$53,310.75	\$4,798.06
22	C19210022		Truaxe Forest Harvesting LLC	\$33,259.56	54%	\$51,330.00	\$4,988.93
23	C19210023		Richard Godden	\$16,851.64	46%	\$24,551.98	\$2,527.75
24	C19210024		Futurewood Corporation	\$20,700.45	55%	\$32,096.66	\$3,105.07
25	C19210025		No Bid	\$9,370.17			

Total Offered: \$513,636.07

Average Bid up: 53%

Total: \$423,392.06 \$647,469.92 \$63,508.81



Feb, 25, 2021 Timber Auction Results

PIKE LAKE AREA

	Appraised Volume	Sold Volume	Average Appraised Value	Average Sold Value	Total Appraised	Total Sold
ASH	570	95	\$3.08	\$7.32	\$1,755.60	\$695.40
ASPEN	6,673	5,466	\$19.47	\$32.67	\$129,938.10	\$178,549.97
BALM OF GILEAD	17	3	\$17.28	\$30.00	\$293.76	\$90.00
BALSAM FIR	474	391	\$5.00	\$5.00	\$2,370.00	\$1,955.00
BASSWOOD	19	6	\$4.61	\$10.00	\$87.68	\$60.00
BIRCH	468	269	\$5.34	\$8.98	\$2,500.21	\$2,416.02
MAPLE-RED	484	216	\$3.19	\$11.68	\$1,542.80	\$2,523.00
MAPLE-SUGAR	226	7	\$3.46	\$12.00	\$781.88	\$84.00
PINE-JACK	17	17	\$16.48	\$17.00	\$280.16	\$289.00
PINE-NORWAY	636	636	\$9.57	\$13.11	\$6,089.62	\$8,337.00
PINE-WHITE	393	393	\$23.33	\$32.80	\$9,166.80	\$12,891.00
SPRUCE-BLACK	968	828	\$18.56	\$21.89	\$17,968.81	\$18,124.86
SPRUCE-WHITE	181	181	\$13.95	\$19.52	\$2,524.10	\$3,533.00
TAMARACK	197	196	\$3.67	\$5.00	\$722.99	\$980.00
Totals	11,323	8,704			\$176,022.51	\$230,528.25



VIRGINIA AREA

	Appraised Volume	Sold Volume	Average Appraised Value	Average Sold Value	Total Appraised	Total Sold
ASH	205	196	\$3.58	\$3.73	\$732.90	\$731.70
ASPEN	13,585	11,416	\$18.66	\$30.36	\$253,468.36	\$346,567.05
BALM OF GILEAD	159	119	\$19.52	\$21.92	\$3,103.66	\$2,607.90
BALSAM FIR	1,576	1,115	\$5.00	\$5.00	\$7,880.00	\$5,575.00
BIRCH	1,276	907	\$5.04	\$8.01	\$6,433.75	\$7,268.18
MAPLE-RED	787	452	\$3.22	\$8.01	\$2,534.59	\$3,618.42
PINE-JACK	794	651	\$17.39	\$19.05	\$13,804.71	\$12,401.30
PINE-NORWAY	1,169	833	\$20.11	\$22.83	\$23,513.21	\$19,019.06
PINE-WHITE	3	3	\$21.63	\$21.63	\$64.89	\$64.89
SPRUCE-BLACK	1,276	997	\$14.76	\$15.64	\$18,837.34	\$15,596.60
SPRUCE-WHITE	470	203	\$9.21	\$9.50	\$4,329.95	\$1,927.95
TAMARACK	454	441	\$3.53	\$3.55	\$1,602.62	\$1,563.62
Totals	21,754	17,333			\$336,305.98	\$416,941.67



Total County

	Appraised Volume	Sold Volume	Average Appraised Value	Average Sold Value	Total Appraised	Total Sold
ASH	775	291	\$3.21	\$4.90	\$2,488.50	\$1,427.10
ASPEN	20,258	16,882	\$18.93	\$31.11	\$383,406.46	\$525,117.02
BALM OF GILEAD	176	122	\$19.30	\$22.11	\$3,397.42	\$2,697.90
BALSAM FIR	2,050	1,506	\$5.00	\$5.00	\$10,250.00	\$7,530.00
BASSWOOD	19	6	\$4.61	\$10.00	\$87.68	\$60.00
BIRCH	1,744	1,176	\$5.12	\$8.23	\$8,933.96	\$9,684.20
MAPLE-RED	1,271	668	\$3.21	\$9.19	\$4,077.39	\$6,141.42
MAPLE-SUGAR	226	7	\$3.46	\$12.00	\$781.88	\$84.00
PINE-JACK	811	668	\$17.37	\$19.00	\$14,084.87	\$12,690.30
PINE-NORWAY	1,805	1,469	\$16.40	\$18.62	\$29,602.83	\$27,356.06
PINE-WHITE	396	396	\$23.31	\$32.72	\$9,231.69	\$12,955.89
SPRUCE-BLACK	2,244	1,825	\$16.40	\$18.48	\$36,806.15	\$33,721.46
SPRUCE-WHITE	651	384	\$10.53	\$14.22	\$6,854.05	\$5,460.95
TAMARACK	651	637	\$3.57	\$3.99	\$2,325.61	\$2,543.62
Totals	33,077	26,037			\$512,328.49	\$647,469.92

Sealed Bid Results Detail

February 25, 2021

Tract	Contract	Contractor Name	App.	Bid	Volume	Value	Winning Bid	Bid Error
Tract 1	C19210001	Brad Horsmann Logging, LLC						
		ASPEN	5.00	7.00	53.00 Cds	\$371.00		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	20.00 Cds	\$100.00		
		BIRCH	5.00	5.00	15.00 Cds	\$75.00		
		MAPLE-RED	5.00	5.00	1.00 Cds	\$5.00		
		PINE-JACK	5.00	6.00	97.00 Cds	\$582.00		
		PINE-NORWAY	5.00	7.00	320.00 Cds	\$2,240.00		
		SPRUCE-WHITE	5.00	5.00	9.00 Cds	\$45.00		
						\$3,418.00	*Winner*	
Tract 2	C19210002	Boise White Paper LLC						
		ASPEN	17.67	23.10	1360.00 Cds	\$31,416.00		
		BALM OF GILEAD	17.67	17.67	26.00 Cds	\$459.42		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	163.00 Cds	\$815.00		
		BIRCH	5.04	5.04	46.00 Cds	\$231.84		
		PINE-JACK	16.48	16.48	3.00 Cds	\$49.44		
		PINE-NORWAY	29.92	29.92	105.00 Cds	\$3,141.60		
		SPRUCE-WHITE	5.00	5.00	50.00 Cds	\$250.00		
						\$36,363.30	*Winner*	
Tract 4	C19210004	Boise White Paper LLC						
		ASPEN	17.67	25.50	753.00 Cds	\$19,201.50		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	45.00 Cds	\$225.00		
		BIRCH	5.04	5.04	58.00 Cds	\$292.32		
		MAPLE-RED	2.97	2.97	50.00 Cds	\$148.50		
		PINE-JACK	16.48	16.48	29.00 Cds	\$477.92		
		PINE-NORWAY	29.92	29.92	213.00 Cds	\$6,372.96		
		SPRUCE-BLACK	5.00	5.00	18.00 Cds	\$90.00		
		SPRUCE-WHITE	5.00	5.00	36.00 Cds	\$180.00		
						\$26,988.20	*Winner*	

Tract	Contract	Contractor Name	App.	Bid	Volume	Value	Winning Bid	Bid Error
		Hedstrom Lumber Co Inc						
		ASPEN	17.67	20.05	753.00 Cds	\$15,097.65		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	45.00 Cds	\$225.00		
		BIRCH	5.04	7.10	58.00 Cds	\$411.80		
		MAPLE-RED	2.97	7.11	50.00 Cds	\$355.50		
		PINE-JACK	16.48	20.08	29.00 Cds	\$582.32		
		PINE-NORWAY	29.92	35.07	213.00 Cds	\$7,469.91		
		SPRUCE-BLACK	5.00	5.00	18.00 Cds	\$90.00		
		SPRUCE-WHITE	5.00	5.00	36.00 Cds	\$180.00		
						\$24,412.18		

Tract 5 C19210029

Shermer Logging

		ASH	3.00	5.10	11.00 Cds	\$56.10		
		ASPEN	17.67	41.35	1661.00 Cds	\$68,682.35		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	40.00 Cds	\$200.00		
		BIRCH	5.04	8.57	42.00 Cds	\$359.94		
		MAPLE-RED	2.97	5.05	15.00 Cds	\$75.75		
		PINE-JACK	16.48	16.48	23.00 Cds	\$379.04		
		SPRUCE-BLACK	13.34	13.34	21.00 Cds	\$280.14		
		SPRUCE-WHITE	13.34	13.34	7.00 Cds	\$93.38		
		TAMARACK	3.33	3.33	53.00 Cds	\$176.49		
						\$70,303.19	*Winner*	

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC

		ASH	3.00	6.00	11.00 Cds	\$66.00		
		ASPEN	17.67	26.50	1661.00 Cds	\$44,016.50		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	40.00 Cds	\$200.00		
		BIRCH	5.04	6.00	42.00 Cds	\$252.00		
		MAPLE-RED	2.97	6.00	15.00 Cds	\$90.00		
		PINE-JACK	16.48	18.00	23.00 Cds	\$414.00		
		SPRUCE-BLACK	13.34	13.34	21.00 Cds	\$280.14		
		SPRUCE-WHITE	13.34	13.34	7.00 Cds	\$93.38		
		TAMARACK	3.33	3.33	53.00 Cds	\$176.49		
						\$45,588.51		

Mike Nielsen Logging

		ASH	3.00	5.00	11.00 Cds	\$55.00		
		ASPEN	17.67	33.00	1661.00 Cds	\$54,813.00		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	40.00 Cds	\$200.00		

Tract	Contract	Contractor Name	App.	Bid	Volume	Value	Winning Bid	Bid Error
		BIRCH	5.04	10.00	42.00 Cds	\$420.00		
		MAPLE-RED	2.97	7.00	15.00 Cds	\$105.00		
		PINE-JACK	16.48	18.00	23.00 Cds	\$414.00		
		SPRUCE-BLACK	13.34	13.34	21.00 Cds	\$280.14		
		SPRUCE-WHITE	13.34	13.34	7.00 Cds	\$93.38		
		TAMARACK	3.33	3.33	53.00 Cds	\$176.49		
							\$56,557.01	
		Truaxe Forest Harvesting LLC						
		ASH	3.00	5.00	11.00 Cds	\$55.00		
		ASPEN	17.67	25.00	1661.00 Cds	\$41,525.00		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	40.00 Cds	\$200.00		
		BIRCH	5.04	10.00	42.00 Cds	\$420.00		
		MAPLE-RED	2.97	6.00	15.00 Cds	\$90.00		
		PINE-JACK	16.48	20.00	23.00 Cds	\$460.00		
		SPRUCE-BLACK	13.34	13.34	21.00 Cds	\$280.14		
		SPRUCE-WHITE	13.34	13.34	7.00 Cds	\$93.38		
		TAMARACK	3.33	3.33	53.00 Cds	\$176.49		
							\$43,300.01	
Tract 6	C19210006							
		Mike Nielsen Logging						
		ASPEN	17.67	30.07	940.00 Cds	\$28,265.80		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	30.00 Cds	\$150.00		
		BIRCH	5.04	15.00	96.00 Cds	\$1,440.00		
		MAPLE-RED	2.97	7.00	17.00 Cds	\$119.00		
		SPRUCE-BLACK	5.00	5.00	10.00 Cds	\$50.00		
		SPRUCE-WHITE	5.00	5.00	6.00 Cds	\$30.00		
							\$30,054.80	*Winner*
		L. Murphy Construct. Inc.						
		ASPEN	17.67	21.56	940.00 Cds	\$20,266.40		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	30.00 Cds	\$150.00		
		BIRCH	5.04	6.15	96.00 Cds	\$590.40		
		MAPLE-RED	2.97	3.97	17.00 Cds	\$67.49		
		SPRUCE-BLACK	5.00	5.00	10.00 Cds	\$50.00		
		SPRUCE-WHITE	5.00	5.00	6.00 Cds	\$30.00		
							\$21,154.29	
		Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC						
		ASPEN	17.67	23.00	940.00 Cds	\$21,620.00		

Tract	Contract	Contractor Name	App.	Bid	Volume	Value	Winning Bid	Bid Error
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	30.00 Cds	\$150.00		
		BIRCH	5.04	6.00	96.00 Cds	\$576.00		
		MAPLE-RED	2.97	6.00	17.00 Cds	\$102.00		
		SPRUCE-BLACK	5.00	5.00	10.00 Cds	\$50.00		
		SPRUCE-WHITE	5.00	5.00	6.00 Cds	\$30.00		
							<u>\$22,528.00</u>	
		Truaxe Forest Harvesting LLC						
		ASPEN	17.67	25.00	940.00 Cds	\$23,500.00		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	30.00 Cds	\$150.00		
		BIRCH	5.04	10.00	96.00 Cds	\$960.00		
		MAPLE-RED	2.97	6.00	17.00 Cds	\$102.00		
		SPRUCE-BLACK	5.00	5.00	10.00 Cds	\$50.00		
		SPRUCE-WHITE	5.00	5.00	6.00 Cds	\$30.00		
							<u>\$24,792.00</u>	
Tract 7	C19210007							
		Shermer Logging						
		ASPEN	17.67	39.40	1071.00 Cds	\$42,197.40		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	58.00 Cds	\$290.00		
		BIRCH	5.04	8.57	280.00 Cds	\$2,399.60		
		MAPLE-RED	2.97	5.05	9.00 Cds	\$45.45		
		SPRUCE-WHITE	11.55	11.55	8.00 Cds	\$92.40		
							<u>\$45,024.85</u>	*Winner*
		Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC						
		ASPEN	17.67	26.00	1071.00 Cds	\$27,846.00		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	58.00 Cds	\$290.00		
		BIRCH	5.04	7.50	280.00 Cds	\$2,100.00		
		MAPLE-RED	2.97	7.50	9.00 Cds	\$67.50		
		SPRUCE-WHITE	11.55	11.55	8.00 Cds	\$92.40		
							<u>\$30,395.90</u>	
		Mike Nielsen Logging						
		ASPEN	17.67	35.10	1071.00 Cds	\$37,592.10		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	58.00 Cds	\$290.00		
		BIRCH	5.04	5.50	280.00 Cds	\$1,540.00		
		MAPLE-RED	2.97	4.15	9.00 Cds	\$37.35		
		SPRUCE-WHITE	11.55	11.55	8.00 Cds	\$92.40		
							<u>\$39,551.85</u>	

Tract	Contract	Contractor Name	App.	Bid	Volume	Value	Winning Bid	Bid Error
Tract 8	C19210008	Mike Nielsen Logging						
		ASPEN	17.67	35.00	621.00 Cds	\$21,735.00		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	20.00 Cds	\$100.00		
		BIRCH	5.04	9.01	83.00 Cds	\$747.83		
		MAPLE-RED	2.97	4.04	18.00 Cds	\$72.72		
		PINE-JACK	16.48	17.66	15.00 Cds	\$264.90		
		PINE-NORWAY	29.92	33.15	30.00 Cds	\$994.50		
		SPRUCE-BLACK	5.00	5.00	7.00 Cds	\$35.00		
		SPRUCE-WHITE	5.00	5.00	18.00 Cds	\$90.00		
						\$24,039.95	*Winner*	
Tract 9	C19210027	Jatco Inc.						
		ASH	3.00	3.00	51.00 Cds	\$153.00		
		ASPEN	17.67	24.00	728.00 Cds	\$17,472.00		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	117.00 Cds	\$585.00		
		BIRCH	5.04	6.00	241.00 Cds	\$1,446.00		
		MAPLE-RED	2.97	3.00	24.00 Cds	\$72.00		
		SPRUCE-BLACK	12.08	12.08	5.00 Cds	\$60.40		
		SPRUCE-WHITE	12.08	12.08	18.00 Cds	\$217.44		
						\$20,005.84	*Winner*	
		Douglas Hustad						
		ASH	3.00	5.00	51.00 Cds	\$255.00		
		ASPEN	17.67	20.00	728.00 Cds	\$14,560.00		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	117.00 Cds	\$585.00		
		BIRCH	5.04	10.00	241.00 Cds	\$2,410.00		
		MAPLE-RED	2.97	5.00	24.00 Cds	\$120.00		
		SPRUCE-BLACK	12.08	12.08	5.00 Cds	\$60.40		
		SPRUCE-WHITE	12.08	12.08	18.00 Cds	\$217.44		
								\$18,207.84
Tract 10	C19210010	UPM Blandin Forestry						
		ASPEN	15.90	16.00	595.00 Cds	\$9,520.00		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	174.00 Cds	\$870.00		

Tract	Contract	Contractor Name	App.	Bid	Volume	Value	Winning Bid	Bid Error
		BIRCH	4.54	4.54	6.00 Cds	\$27.24		
		MAPLE-RED	2.67	4.00	92.00 Cds	\$368.00		
		SPRUCE-BLACK	12.53	13.25	430.00 Cds	\$5,697.50		
		TAMARACK	3.00	3.00	218.00 Cds	\$654.00		
						\$17,136.74	*Winner*	

Tract 11 **C19210030**

Futurewood Corporation

	ASH	3.90	3.90	134.00 Cds	\$522.60		
	ASPEN	22.97	27.00	1398.00 Cds	\$37,746.00		
	BALM OF GILEAD	22.08	22.08	81.00 Cds	\$1,788.48		
	BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	245.00 Cds	\$1,225.00		
	BIRCH	6.55	6.55	31.00 Cds	\$203.05		
	MAPLE-RED	3.86	12.00	226.00 Cds	\$2,712.00		
	SPRUCE-BLACK	18.91	18.91	427.00 Cds	\$8,074.57		
	SPRUCE-WHITE	18.91	18.91	34.00 Cds	\$642.94		
	TAMARACK	4.33	4.33	161.00 Cds	\$697.13		
						\$53,611.77	*Winner*

Jatco Inc.

	ASH	3.90	3.90	134.00 Cds	\$522.60		
	ASPEN	22.97	24.50	1398.00 Cds	\$34,251.00		
	BALM OF GILEAD	22.08	24.50	81.00 Cds	\$1,984.50		
	BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	245.00 Cds	\$1,225.00		
	BIRCH	6.55	6.55	31.00 Cds	\$203.05		
	MAPLE-RED	3.86	4.00	226.00 Cds	\$904.00		
	SPRUCE-BLACK	18.91	18.91	427.00 Cds	\$8,074.57		
	SPRUCE-WHITE	18.91	18.91	34.00 Cds	\$642.94		
	TAMARACK	4.33	4.33	161.00 Cds	\$697.13		
						\$48,504.79	

UPM Blandin Forestry

	ASH	3.90	4.00	134.00 Cds	\$536.00		
	ASPEN	22.97	25.50	1398.00 Cds	\$35,649.00		
	BALM OF GILEAD	22.08	22.10	81.00 Cds	\$1,790.10		
	BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	245.00 Cds	\$1,225.00		
	BIRCH	6.55	6.60	31.00 Cds	\$204.60		
	MAPLE-RED	3.86	4.00	226.00 Cds	\$904.00		
	SPRUCE-BLACK	18.91	18.91	427.00 Cds	\$8,074.57		

Tract	Contract	Contractor Name	App.	Bid	Volume	Value	Winning Bid	Bid Error
		SPRUCE-WHITE	18.91	18.91	34.00 Cds	\$642.94		
		TAMARACK	4.33	4.50	161.00 Cds	\$724.50		
							\$49,750.71	

Tract 13 C19210028

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC

	ASPEN	21.21	30.00	1948.00 Cds	\$58,440.00
	BALM OF GILEAD	20.38	30.00	12.00 Cds	\$360.00
	BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	46.00 Cds	\$230.00
	PINE-JACK	19.78	22.00	484.00 Cds	\$10,648.00
	SPRUCE-BLACK	16.87	16.87	77.00 Cds	\$1,298.99
	SPRUCE-WHITE	16.87	16.87	17.00 Cds	\$286.79
	TAMARACK	4.00	4.00	9.00 Cds	\$36.00
					\$71,299.78 *Winner*

Jatco Inc.

	ASPEN	21.21	26.10	1948.00 Cds	\$50,842.80
	BALM OF GILEAD	20.38	26.10	12.00 Cds	\$313.20
	BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	46.00 Cds	\$230.00
	PINE-JACK	19.78	20.00	484.00 Cds	\$9,680.00
	SPRUCE-BLACK	16.87	16.87	77.00 Cds	\$1,298.99
	SPRUCE-WHITE	16.87	16.87	17.00 Cds	\$286.79
	TAMARACK	4.00	4.00	9.00 Cds	\$36.00
					\$62,687.78

Tract 14 C19210014

Raad Logging Inc

	ASPEN	17.67	40.00	288.00 Cds	\$11,520.00
	BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	157.00 Cds	\$785.00
	BIRCH	5.04	5.04	9.00 Cds	\$45.36
	PINE-NORWAY	29.92	38.00	165.00 Cds	\$6,270.00
	PINE-WHITE	21.63	21.63	3.00 Cds	\$64.89
	SPRUCE-BLACK	5.00	5.00	2.00 Cds	\$10.00
					\$18,695.25 *Winner*

Douglas Hustad

	ASPEN	17.67	20.00	288.00 Cds	\$5,760.00
	BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	157.00 Cds	\$785.00

Tract	Contract	Contractor Name	App.	Bid	Volume	Value	Winning Bid	Bid Error
		BIRCH	5.04	6.00	9.00 Cds	\$54.00		
		PINE-NORWAY	29.92	30.00	165.00 Cds	\$4,950.00		
		PINE-WHITE	21.63	22.00	3.00 Cds	\$66.00		
		SPRUCE-BLACK	5.00	5.00	2.00 Cds	\$10.00		
						\$11,625.00		
		Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC						
		ASPEN	17.67	25.00	288.00 Cds	\$7,200.00		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	157.00 Cds	\$785.00		
		BIRCH	5.04	6.00	9.00 Cds	\$54.00		
		PINE-NORWAY	29.92	32.00	165.00 Cds	\$5,280.00		
		PINE-WHITE	21.63	22.00	3.00 Cds	\$66.00		
		SPRUCE-BLACK	5.00	5.00	2.00 Cds	\$10.00		
						\$13,395.00		

Tract 17 C19210017

Fjeran Forest Products Llc

ASPEN	5.00	7.00	54.00 Cds	\$378.00
BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	49.00 Cds	\$245.00
BIRCH	5.00	7.00	3.00 Cds	\$21.00
PINE-NORWAY	5.00	7.00	531.00 Cds	\$3,717.00
PINE-WHITE	5.00	7.00	3.00 Cds	\$21.00
SPRUCE-BLACK	5.00	7.00	5.00 Cds	\$35.00
				\$4,417.00 *Winner*

Nelson Logging LLC

ASPEN	5.00	5.25	54.00 Cds	\$283.50
BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	49.00 Cds	\$245.00
BIRCH	5.00	5.25	3.00 Cds	\$15.75
PINE-NORWAY	5.00	5.25	531.00 Cds	\$2,787.75
PINE-WHITE	5.00	5.25	3.00 Cds	\$15.75
SPRUCE-BLACK	5.00	5.25	5.00 Cds	\$26.25
				\$3,374.00

Tract 18 C19210018

Fjeran Forest Products Llc

ASPEN	17.67	18.00	34.00 Cds	\$612.00
BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	8.00 Cds	\$40.00

Tract	Contract	Contractor Name	App.	Bid	Volume	Value	Winning Bid	Bid Error
		BIRCH	5.04	7.00	44.00 Cds	\$308.00		
		MAPLE-RED	2.97	7.00	6.00 Cds	\$42.00		
		PINE-JACK	16.48	17.00	17.00 Cds	\$289.00		
		PINE-NORWAY	29.92	30.00	7.00 Cds	\$210.00		
		PINE-WHITE	21.63	22.00	60.00 Cds	\$1,320.00		
		SPRUCE-BLACK	13.93	13.93	2.00 Cds	\$27.86		
						\$2,848.86	*Winner*	

Jatco Inc.

		ASPEN	17.67	18.00	34.00 Cds	\$612.00		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	8.00 Cds	\$40.00		
		BIRCH	5.04	5.04	44.00 Cds	\$221.76		
		MAPLE-RED	2.97	2.97	6.00 Cds	\$17.82		
		PINE-JACK	16.48	16.48	17.00 Cds	\$280.16		
		PINE-NORWAY	29.92	30.00	7.00 Cds	\$210.00		
		PINE-WHITE	21.63	22.00	60.00 Cds	\$1,320.00		
		SPRUCE-BLACK	13.93	13.93	2.00 Cds	\$27.86		
						\$2,729.60		

Nelson Logging LLC

		ASPEN	17.67	17.67	34.00 Cds	\$600.78		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	8.00 Cds	\$40.00		
		BIRCH	5.04	5.04	44.00 Cds	\$221.76		
		MAPLE-RED	2.97	2.97	6.00 Cds	\$17.82		
		PINE-JACK	16.48	16.48	17.00 Cds	\$280.16		
		PINE-NORWAY	29.92	29.92	7.00 Cds	\$209.44		
		PINE-WHITE	21.63	21.63	60.00 Cds	\$1,297.80		
		SPRUCE-BLACK	13.93	13.93	2.00 Cds	\$27.86		
						\$2,695.62		

Tract 19 C19210019

Richard Godden

		ASPEN	19.44	25.00	277.00 Cds	\$6,925.00		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	115.00 Cds	\$575.00		
		SPRUCE-BLACK	19.15	22.00	821.00 Cds	\$18,062.00		
		SPRUCE-WHITE	15.90	22.00	59.00 Cds	\$1,298.00		
		TAMARACK	3.67	5.00	196.00 Cds	\$980.00		
						\$27,840.00	*Winner*	

Tract	Contract	Contractor Name	App.	Bid	Volume	Value	Winning Bid	Bid Error
		Jatco Inc.						
		ASPEN	19.44	20.00	277.00 Cds	\$5,540.00		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	115.00 Cds	\$575.00		
		SPRUCE-BLACK	19.15	19.20	821.00 Cds	\$15,763.20		
		SPRUCE-WHITE	15.90	16.00	59.00 Cds	\$944.00		
		TAMARACK	3.67	3.67	196.00 Cds	\$719.32		
							\$23,541.52	
		UPM Blandin Forestry						
		ASPEN	19.44	21.00	277.00 Cds	\$5,817.00		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	115.00 Cds	\$575.00		
		SPRUCE-BLACK	19.15	19.25	821.00 Cds	\$15,804.25		
		SPRUCE-WHITE	15.90	19.25	59.00 Cds	\$1,135.75		
		TAMARACK	3.67	4.00	196.00 Cds	\$784.00		
							\$24,116.00	
Tract	C19210020							
20								
		Sappi Fine Paper						
		ASPEN	19.44	44.00	729.00 Cds	\$32,076.00		
		BIRCH	5.54	11.00	148.00 Cds	\$1,628.00		
		MAPLE-RED	3.26	11.00	39.00 Cds	\$429.00		
							\$34,133.00	*Winner*
		Douglas Hustad						
		ASPEN	19.44	20.00	729.00 Cds	\$14,580.00		
		BIRCH	5.54	6.00	148.00 Cds	\$888.00		
		MAPLE-RED	3.26	4.00	39.00 Cds	\$156.00		
							\$15,624.00	
		Fjeran Forest Products Llc						
		ASPEN	19.44	41.55	729.00 Cds	\$30,289.95		
		BIRCH	5.54	8.00	148.00 Cds	\$1,184.00		
		MAPLE-RED	3.26	8.00	39.00 Cds	\$312.00		
							\$31,785.95	
		Futurewood Corporation						
		ASPEN	19.44	39.07	729.00 Cds	\$28,482.03		
		BIRCH	5.54	13.00	148.00 Cds	\$1,924.00		
		MAPLE-RED	3.26	10.00	39.00 Cds	\$390.00		
							\$30,796.03	

Tract	Contract	Contractor Name	App.	Bid	Volume	Value	Winning Bid	Bid Error
		Jatco Inc.						
		ASPEN	19.44	38.25	729.00 Cds	\$27,884.25		
		BIRCH	5.54	6.00	148.00 Cds	\$888.00		
		MAPLE-RED	3.26	4.00	39.00 Cds	\$156.00		
						\$28,928.25		
		Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC						
		ASPEN	19.44	32.00	729.00 Cds	\$23,328.00		
		BIRCH	5.54	10.00	148.00 Cds	\$1,480.00		
		MAPLE-RED	3.26	10.00	39.00 Cds	\$390.00		
						\$25,198.00		
		Raad Logging Inc						
		ASPEN	19.44	40.00	729.00 Cds	\$29,160.00		
		BIRCH	5.54	12.00	148.00 Cds	\$1,776.00		
		MAPLE-RED	3.26	12.00	39.00 Cds	\$468.00		
						\$31,404.00		
		Richard Godden						
		ASPEN	19.44	30.00	729.00 Cds	\$21,870.00		
		BIRCH	5.54	10.00	148.00 Cds	\$1,480.00		
		MAPLE-RED	3.26	5.00	39.00 Cds	\$195.00		
						\$23,545.00		
		Truaxe Forest Harvesting LLC						
		ASPEN	19.44	30.00	729.00 Cds	\$21,870.00		
		BIRCH	5.54	12.00	148.00 Cds	\$1,776.00		
		MAPLE-RED	3.26	6.00	39.00 Cds	\$234.00		
						\$23,880.00		
Tract	C19210021							
21								
		Futurewood Corporation						
		ASH	3.60	10.00	57.00 Cds	\$570.00		
		ASPEN	21.21	35.01	1475.00 Cds	\$51,639.75		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	35.00 Cds	\$175.00		
		BASSWOOD	5.21	10.00	6.00 Cds	\$60.00		
		BIRCH	6.05	10.00	11.00 Cds	\$110.00		
		MAPLE-RED	3.56	12.00	63.00 Cds	\$756.00		
						\$53,310.75	*Winner*	

Tract	Contract	Contractor Name	App.	Bid	Volume	Value	Winning Bid	Bid Error
		Sappi Fine Paper						
		ASH	3.60	11.00	57.00 Cds	\$627.00		
		ASPEN	21.21	34.50	1475.00 Cds	\$50,887.50		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	35.00 Cds	\$175.00		
		BASSWOOD	5.21	11.00	6.00 Cds	\$66.00		
		BIRCH	6.05	11.00	11.00 Cds	\$121.00		
		MAPLE-RED	3.56	11.00	63.00 Cds	\$693.00		
							\$52,569.50	
		UPM Blandin Forestry						
		ASH	3.60	5.00	57.00 Cds	\$285.00		
		ASPEN	21.21	29.25	1475.00 Cds	\$43,143.75		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	35.00 Cds	\$175.00		
		BASSWOOD	5.21	5.25	6.00 Cds	\$31.50		
		BIRCH	6.05	7.00	11.00 Cds	\$77.00		
		MAPLE-RED	3.56	7.00	63.00 Cds	\$441.00		
							\$44,153.25	
Tract	C19210022							
22								
		Truaxe Forest Harvesting LLC						
		ASPEN	19.44	30.00	1708.00 Cds	\$51,240.00		
		BALM OF GILEAD	18.68	30.00	3.00 Cds	\$90.00		
							\$51,330.00	*Winner*
		Greg Cook Logging						
		ASPEN	19.44	28.19	1708.00 Cds	\$48,148.52		
		BALM OF GILEAD	18.68	28.19	3.00 Cds	\$84.57		
							\$48,233.09	
		Jatco Inc.						
		ASPEN	19.44	25.50	1708.00 Cds	\$43,554.00		
		BALM OF GILEAD	18.68	25.50	3.00 Cds	\$76.50		
							\$43,630.50	
		Sappi Fine Paper						
		ASPEN	19.44	25.30	1708.00 Cds	\$43,212.40		
		BALM OF GILEAD	18.68	25.30	3.00 Cds	\$75.90		
							\$43,288.30	
		Wood Timber Enterprises, Inc.						
		ASPEN	19.44	24.25	1708.00 Cds	\$41,419.00		

Tract	Contract	Contractor Name	App.	Bid	Volume	Value	Winning Bid	Bid Error
		BALM OF GILEAD	18.68	24.25	3.00 Cds	\$72.75		
							\$41,491.75	

Tract 23 C19210023

Richard Godden

ASPEN	19.44	30.00	267.00 Cds	\$8,010.00
BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	65.00 Cds	\$325.00
BIRCH	5.54	5.54	37.00 Cds	\$204.98
PINE-NORWAY	32.91	45.00	98.00 Cds	\$4,410.00
PINE-WHITE	23.80	35.00	330.00 Cds	\$11,550.00
SPRUCE-WHITE	13.00	13.00	4.00 Cds	\$52.00

\$24,551.98 *Winner*

Hedstrom Lumber Co Inc

ASPEN	19.44	21.50	267.00 Cds	\$5,740.50
BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	65.00 Cds	\$325.00
BIRCH	5.54	5.54	37.00 Cds	\$204.98
PINE-NORWAY	32.91	44.00	98.00 Cds	\$4,312.00
PINE-WHITE	23.80	25.50	330.00 Cds	\$8,415.00
SPRUCE-WHITE	13.00	13.00	4.00 Cds	\$52.00

\$19,049.48

Tract 24 C19210024

Futurewood Corporation

ASH	3.30	3.30	38.00 Cds	\$125.40
ASPEN	19.44	30.01	922.00 Cds	\$27,669.22
BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	119.00 Cds	\$595.00
BIRCH	5.54	5.54	26.00 Cds	\$144.04
MAPLE-RED	3.26	12.00	108.00 Cds	\$1,296.00
MAPLE-SUGAR	3.75	12.00	7.00 Cds	\$84.00
SPRUCE-WHITE	13.00	18.50	118.00 Cds	\$2,183.00

\$32,096.66 *Winner*

Jatco Inc.

ASH	3.30	3.30	38.00 Cds	\$125.40
ASPEN	19.44	24.75	922.00 Cds	\$22,819.50
BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	119.00 Cds	\$595.00

Tract	Contract	Contractor Name	App.	Bid	Volume	Value	Winning Bid	Bid Error
		BIRCH	5.54	5.54	26.00 Cds	\$144.04		
		MAPLE-RED	3.26	4.00	108.00 Cds	\$432.00		
		MAPLE-SUGAR	3.75	4.00	7.00 Cds	\$28.00		
		SPRUCE-WHITE	13.00	15.00	118.00 Cds	\$1,770.00		
							\$25,913.94	
		Sappi Fine Paper						
		ASH	3.30	3.30	38.00 Cds	\$125.40		
		ASPEN	19.44	19.44	922.00 Cds	\$17,923.68		
		BALSAM FIR	5.00	5.00	119.00 Cds	\$595.00		
		BIRCH	5.54	5.54	26.00 Cds	\$144.04		
		MAPLE-RED	3.26	3.26	108.00 Cds	\$352.08		
		MAPLE-SUGAR	3.75	3.75	7.00 Cds	\$26.25		
		SPRUCE-WHITE	13.00	13.00	118.00 Cds	\$1,534.00		
							\$20,700.45	