

## June 2021 - AUCTION SUMMARY

<b>Tract</b>	<b>Contract</b>	<b>LDKey</b>	<b>Bidder Name</b>	<b>Appraised Price</b>	<b>Sale Amount</b>
1	C22210022	100110	Juan Cordova	\$6,000.00	\$13,000.00
2	C22200244	100202	NO BID	\$26,900.00	\$0.00
3	C22200245	100210	NO BID	\$13,450.00	\$0.00
4	C22210023	100357	Merooan Mirijanian	\$5,100.00	\$5,200.00
5	C22210024	125330	Warren M Williams	\$75,750.00	\$97,100.00
6	C22210073	101528	David F Pueringer	\$4,350.00	\$4,350.00
7	C22210026	125125	David J Lubbesmeyer	\$16,725.00	\$16,725.00
8	C22200247	9000002852	NO BID	\$22,575.00	\$0.00
9	C22210083	125398	Vandale Willis	\$34,134.45	\$85,434.45
10	C22210084	104355	Shawn Lewis	\$4,725.00	\$4,725.00
11	C22210027	104396	Ashley E Milberger	\$4,425.00	\$4,425.00
12	C22210094	9000003051	Tom Anderson	\$48,225.00	\$51,250.00
13	C22210028	125426	PULLED	\$22,878.09	\$0.00
14	C22190215	104994	Nicholas Thieling	\$250.00	\$255.00
15	C22210096	9000003091	NO BID	\$6,075.00	\$0.00
16	C22210033	9000002954	Christopher T Jungwirth	\$3,675.00	\$3,675.00
17	C22200123	105017	NO BID	\$2,775.00	\$0.00
18	C22210034	125434	Kyle E Ohlenkamp	\$26,450.00	\$70,500.00
19	C22210035	125436	Brad J Nygaard	\$41,195.68	\$41,295.68
20	C22210036	125437	Renee K Jerry	\$22,058.59	\$62,109.59
21	C22200250	9000002871	NO BID	\$3,300.00	\$0.00
22	C22210037	123206	NO BID	\$16,575.00	\$0.00
23	C22210038	125467	Josh Goldberg	\$67,600.00	\$67,600.00
24	C22210039	125468	NO BID	\$10,500.00	\$0.00
25	C22210040	105863	Benjamin R Ree	\$25,000.00	\$25,000.00
26	C22210041	105864	Benjamin R Ree	\$11,600.00	\$11,600.00

<b>Tract</b>	<b>Contract</b>	<b>LDKey</b>	<b>Bidder Name</b>	<b>Appraised Price</b>	<b>Sale Amount</b>
27	C22210086	9000003011	NO BID	\$11,775.00	\$0.00
28	C22200193	122487	NO BID	\$40,000.00	\$0.00
29	C22200194	122488	NO BID	\$41,300.00	\$0.00
30	C22200199	122495	NO BID	\$49,000.00	\$0.00
31	C22200200	122496	NO BID	\$43,000.00	\$0.00
32	C22210045	122628	NO BID	\$41,100.00	\$0.00
33	C22210046	122633	NO BID	\$41,500.00	\$0.00
34	C22210095	9000003071	William Kaper Jr	\$24,000.00	\$61,105.00
35	C22210059	9000002975	NO BID	\$15,375.00	\$0.00
36	C22210060	9000002976	Steve Sauerbry	\$17,850.00	\$17,850.00
37	C22210061	107986	Gregg Rosenberger	\$13,275.00	\$13,275.00
38	C22210066	9000002981	Alvin Ahti Hujanen and Florette Dianne	\$55,400.00	\$55,400.00
39	C22210067	125487	Benjamin Matthew Hatfield	\$13,500.00	\$13,500.00
40	C22210068	110503	NO BID	\$40,500.00	\$0.00
41	C22200258	111210	NO BID	\$15,200.00	\$0.00
42	C22210069	111658	PULLED	\$18,150.00	\$0.00
43	C22210074	112140	Bruce M Sandberg	\$6,200.00	\$7,000.00
44	C22210075	112853	NO BID	\$31,300.00	\$0.00
45	C22210076	113913	Dale Niemi	\$21,000.00	\$21,800.00
46	C22200162	9000002760	Michelle Ellis	\$5,100.00	\$5,100.00
47	C22200260	123805	Rodney Charles Knutson	\$3,100.00	\$3,100.00
48	C22210077	121261	Carole J Clark	\$20,500.00	\$45,600.00
49	C22200232	120894	NO BID	\$30,900.00	\$0.00
50	C22200235	120913	Christian J Proetz	\$34,200.00	\$40,400.00
51	C22200238	121745	PULLED	\$24,500.00	\$0.00
52	C22210078	123813	Jason Hancock	\$20,400.00	\$55,200.00
53	C22210079	115909	NO BID	\$8,700.00	\$0.00

<b>Tract</b>	<b>Contract</b>	<b>LDKey</b>	<b>Bidder Name</b>	<b>Appraised Price</b>	<b>Sale Amount</b>
<b>Total Tracts</b>			53	<b>Total Value</b> \$1,209,116.81	
<b>Pulled Tracts</b>			3	<b>Pulled Tracts Value</b> \$0.00	
<b>Net Available Tracts</b>			50	<b>Net Total Value</b> \$1,209,116.81	\$903,574.72
<b>Total Tracts Sold</b>			29		
<b>Percent of Available Tracts Sold</b>			58.00%	<b>Percent of Appraised Value Sold</b>	74.73%