

July 2021 - ONLINE AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract	Contract	LDKey	Bidder Name	Appraised Price	Sale Amount
1	C22200119	100050	Philip Nelson	\$6,980.00	\$6,980.00
2	C22200267	9000002912	NO BID	\$51,825.00	\$0.00
3	C22200243	100568	NO BID	\$14,050.00	\$0.00
4	C22180351	9000002237	NO BID	\$36,100.00	\$0.00
5	C22200247	9000002852	NO BID	\$22,575.00	\$0.00
6	C22200183	104236	NO BID	\$28,150.00	\$0.00
7	C22190137	123656	NO BID	\$9,800.00	\$0.00
8	C22210096	9000003091	Kizito O. Adejumo	\$6,075.00	\$6,177.00
9	C22190044	9000002292	JeffD Lindell	\$6,375.00	\$10,100.00
10	C22200250	9000002871	NO BID	\$3,300.00	\$0.00
11	C22170327	118362	NO BID	\$7,920.00	\$0.00
12	C22200129	9000002753	NO BID	\$2,250.00	\$0.00
13	C22180072	105478	NO BID	\$3,175.00	\$0.00
14	C22180071	105566	NO BID	\$7,875.00	\$0.00
15	C22200130	105812	NO BID	\$33,760.00	\$0.00
16	C22190224	106045	NO BID	\$4,125.00	\$0.00
17	C22200193	122487	NO BID	\$40,000.00	\$0.00
18	C22210045	122628	NO BID	\$41,100.00	\$0.00
19	C22210059	9000002975	NO BID	\$15,375.00	\$0.00
20	C22190156	108049	Jake Dean Schmidt	\$55,750.00	\$55,750.00
21	C22200011	9000002652	NO BID	\$15,000.00	\$0.00
22	C22200141	108339	NO BID	\$42,615.00	\$0.00
23	C22200207	122272	NO BID	\$81,720.00	\$0.00
24	C22200152	122853	NO BID	\$60,200.00	\$0.00
25	C22200111	109785	NO BID	\$41,850.00	\$0.00
26	C22210068	110503	NO BID	\$40,500.00	\$0.00

Tract	Contract	LDKey	Bidder Name	Appraised Price	Sale Amount
27	C22200154	118132	Kizito O. Adejumo	\$9,300.00	\$9,300.00
28	C22180081	110890	NO BID	\$68,456.00	\$0.00
29	C22210075	112853	Carl F Lindstrom	\$31,300.00	\$31,300.00
30	C22210079	115909	NO BID	\$8,700.00	\$0.00
31	C22210038	125467	NO BID	\$67,600.00	\$0.00
32	C22210083	125398	Julie Elliott	\$34,134.45	\$85,334.45
Total Tracts			32	Total Value	\$897,935.45
Pulled Tracts			0	Pulled Tracts Value	\$0.00
Net Available Tracts			32	Net Total Value	\$897,935.45
Total Tracts Sold			7		\$204,941.45
Percent of Available Tracts Sold			21.88%	Percent of Appraised Value Sold	22.82%