

January 2021 - ONLINE AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract	Contract	LDKey	Bidder Name	Appraised Price	Sale Amount
1	C22180324	9000002233	NO BID	\$31,742.10	\$0.00
5	C22200053	100682	NO BID	\$2,362.50	\$0.00
7	C22180351	9000002237	NO BID	\$39,999.00	\$0.00
8	C22200120	9000002751	Thomas W Anderson	\$29,000.00	\$29,000.00
9	C22180256	101774	NO BID	\$2,743.60	\$0.00
10	C22180337	102880	NO BID	\$6,115.20	\$0.00
11	C22170332	9000001715	NO BID	\$5,936.37	\$0.00
13	C22190137	123656	NO BID	\$11,542.50	\$0.00
14	C22190044	9000002292	NO BID	\$7,085.23	\$0.00
15	C22190012	105072	NO BID	\$1,240.00	\$0.00
16	C22170315	9000001693	NO BID	\$7,266.00	\$0.00
19	C22190038	105308	NO BID	\$8,160.89	\$0.00
20	C22200051	124097	NO BID	\$7,218.02	\$0.00
21	C22180108	105313	NO BID	\$1,543.22	\$0.00
23	C22180365	9000002238	NO BID	\$3,865.66	\$0.00
24	C22170320	105458	Larry Patrick Jacques and Wendy Ann M	\$1,567.78	\$1,567.78
25	C22170327	118362	NO BID	\$9,786.33	\$0.00
26	C22200129	9000002753	NO BID	\$3,105.00	\$0.00
27	C22180072	105478	NO BID	\$3,175.33	\$0.00
28	C22170024	9000001316	NO BID	\$7,770.00	\$0.00
30	C22190220	123208	Mikey Shan	\$4,125.00	\$4,125.00
31	C22200130	105812	NO BID	\$65,880.00	\$0.00
34	C22180129	9000001996	NO BID	\$8,525.39	\$0.00
37	C22190156	108049	NO BID	\$68,850.00	\$0.00
38	C22200011	9000002652	NO BID	\$18,527.67	\$0.00
39	C22200012	122841	NO BID	\$12,756.48	\$0.00
40	C22200141	108339	NO BID	\$73,920.00	\$0.00

Tract	Contract	LDKey	Bidder Name	Appraised Price	Sale Amount
42	C22200152	122853	NO BID	\$74,300.00	\$0.00
43	C22200154	118132	NO BID	\$12,900.00	\$0.00
45	C22180081	110890	NO BID	\$85,570.45	\$0.00
47	C22190261	113563	NO BID	\$11,169.00	\$0.00
49	C22200110	124009	NO BID	\$4,200.00	\$0.00

Total Tracts	32	Total Value	\$631,948.70	
Pulled Tracts	0	Pulled Tracts Value	\$0.00	
Net Available Tracts	32	Net Total Value	\$631,948.70	\$34,692.78
Total Tracts Sold	3			
Percent of Available Tracts Sold	9.38%	Percent of Appraised Value Sold		5.49%